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PHOTOCLINIC

A 21-year-old man was brought to the 
emergency department (ED) by his 
mother, who reported that the patient 
had been experiencing visual hallucina-
tions and paranoia for the past 4 days. 
The mother denied a history of similar 
episodes and denied a family history of 
psychiatric disorders.

The patient had a medical history 
significant for traumatic brain injury (TBI) 
secondary to a motor vehicle collision that 
had occurred 5 years prior to presentation. 

Physical examination
The patient had a guarded and irritated 

affect, saying, “I feel fine” when ques-
tioned. He reported having smoked 
marijuana and was orientated to person, 
place, and time. Despite this, the patient 
was physically agitated. Intravenous 
haloperidol, 5 mg, intravenous lorazepam, 
1 mg, and oral diphenhydramine, 50 mg 
were administered in the ED.

A urine toxicology screen was positive 
for cannabis. The patient’s complete 

blood cell count, renal function and liver 
enzyme, thyroid-stimulating hormone, 
rapid plasma reagin, vitamin B12, and 
folate levels were within normal limits. An 
electrocardiogram was unremarkable. A 
magnetic resonance imaging (MRI) scan 
was performed, results of which showed 
advanced basal ganglia mineralization for 
the patient’s age (Figure). A lumbar punc-
ture was performed, and results were 
negative for infection. An electroencepha-
logram did not show any seizure activity.

Because new-onset schizophrenia was 
high on our differential diagnosis, a neu-
rologist and psychiatrist were consulted. 
Because of the abnormalities on the MRI 
scan, bilateral striopallidodentate calcino-
sis was also considered in the differential 
diagnosis. However, it was determined 
that the lesions seen on the MRI were 
related to the patient’s history of TBI.

Our final diagnosis was cannabis- 
induced psychosis in the setting of TBI. 
The patient’s mentation returned to base-
line by hospital day 4 after treatment with 

haloperidol, 5 mg, lorazepam, 1 mg, and 
diphenhydramine, 50 mg. He was then 
discharged home. The patient followed up 
with his primary care provider, where he 
reported continued cannabis use.

Discussion
Cannabis is the most widely used 

illicit psychoactive agent in the world.1 
In the United States, there are varying 
levels of legality across the states, and 
usage has become more widespread. It 
is well known that there is a significant 
association between cannabis use and 
psychoactive disorders. The findings of 
our case report highlight the importance 
of increased awareness of the adverse 
effects of cannabis use, particularly the 
induction of psychosis.  

About 20% of teenagers and young 
adults worldwide have reported cannabis 
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Figure. The patient’s MRI scan showed 
advanced basal ganglia mineralization for 
his age.
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use at least once per week or heavy use 
(ie, > 100 occasions).2 Moore and col-
leagues reviewed 35 studies worldwide 
and found a 40% risk of psychosis in par-
ticipants who had ever used cannabis.2 
Another study conducted by Starzer and 
colleagues showed that 32% of partici-
pants with cannabis-induced psychosis 
were later diagnosed with bipolar/schizo-
phrenia.3 Participants using cannabis 
had the highest conversion to bipolar/
schizophrenia (47.4%) than participants 
using any other substance.3 Participants 
aged 16 to 25 years and men were at the 
highest risk of any substance-induced 
psychosis, while individuals aged older 
than 51 years were at the lowest risk.3

Conclusions
Our case supports other data being 

published in the United States. Frequent 
cannabis users are at the greatest risk of 
developing psychosis. Subtle cognitive 
deficits can be noted at least 7 days after 
heavy cannabis use; after 28 days, virtu-
ally no deficits can be noted, suggesting 
reversible neurologic effects.4

Synthetic cannabis is much more 
potent than natural cannabis and does not 
include the cannabidiol component that 
otherwise counteracts the psychoactive 
components of the tetrahydrocannabinol.5 
Cannabis-induced psychosis should be 
considered in the differential diagnosis of 
patients who present with encephalopa-

thy, and patients should be counseled on 
potential adverse effects of cannabis use.
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